
Notes and B-fief Reports 

Black Lung Amendments of 1977” 
The Black Lung Benefits Reform Act of 1977 (Pubhc 

Law 95-239),was slgned by the President on March 1, 
1978 A month earher, on February 10. the finanaal 
provwons of the program were amended under the 
Black Lung Benefits Revenue Act of 1977 (Publtc Law 
95-227) These comprehenwe amendments to the Fed- 
eral Coal Mme Health and Safety Act of 1969 hberahze 
the eltgtblhty provwons under which coal mmers and 
their dependent s”rvtvors recetve benefits for 
pneumocomosts (black lung dwease) 

Mtt~@f changes resultmg from the new legtslatlon m- 
elude the followmg 

Expanston of the defuutlon of “mmer” and modlft- 
catlo” of the rules concermng dlsablhty covered under 
the Act 
Notlftcatton of mmers recewrng cash benefits under 
Part B of the Act of possrble entttlement to medical 
benefits 
Llberaltzatton of the prows,ons offsettmg black lung 
benefits because of the recetpt of workers’ compensa- 
t1on 
Estabhshment of a black lung dlsablhty tmst fund to 
finance the cost of current clams not attnbutable to a 
responstble mme operator 
Ehmmatlon of the 1981 termmatlon date previously tn 
the law, thereby makmg the black lung benefit 
program permanent , 

New Definitions and Rules 
Definition of mmer. The term “mmer” now Includes 

managers and owners who themselves have worked m 
the extractton of coal and mdtvtduals who process coal, 
transport It, or construct coal mmes Previously, only 
workers wtth dtsabtltttes artsmg from the actual mmmg 
of coal were ehglble for benefits 

Effect of employment on duability determinatron. 
Before P L 95-239 went mto effect, clams generally 
were demed on the bats of employment status, regard- 
less of the type of work bang performed and wthout 
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addItIonal mquwy mto the posslblhty of dlsabdtty The 
law now prowdes that current employment I” a mme 
cannot be used as conclusive ewdence that a mmer IS 
not totally disabled tf the nature of hts Job has changed 
m a way that mdlcates a reduced ablhty to perform hts 
usual coal-mme work Stmtlarly, a determmatlon ~111 
not be made that a deceased mmer, solely because he 
was employed m a mme when he died, was not totally 
disabled 

New survivor benefits. Dependent s”rv~vors of mm- 
ers who died up to March 1, 1978 (the date of enact- 
ment of P L 95-239) ~111 be ehglble for benefits If the 
mmer had at least 25 years of coal-mme employment 
before June 30, 1971, unless It IS defimtely establtshed 
that he was not parttally or totally disabled because of 
black lung disease at the time of death Where no medl- 
cal or other relevant ewdence 1s wadable, affidavtts by 
the wdow or others with knowledge of the mmer’s con- 
dltlon ~111 now be constdered suffwent evtdence to es- 
tabluh that dlsabtltty or death was caused by 
pneumocomosls This provwon extends that part of the 
law allowmg the payment of benefits to s”rwvors of 
mmers wtth a mmtmum of 10 or 15 years of mmmg 
expertence and an estabhshed dlsablmg respuatory con- 
dltlon of speafted severtty 

Slmphfied medleal-evidence requwement. When 
other ewdence exuts of a pulmonary or respiratory rm- 
patrment, mterpretatton of chest X-rays by board- 
quahfied phystaans ~111 now be accepted as vahd en- 
dence wtthout further rewew, unless fraud IS suspected 
or the X-ray film IS not of adequate quahty to demon- 
strate the presence of black lung disease Before the 
amendments, a majortty of X-rays reread by consultmg 
radtologlsts for the Department of Labor reversed post- 
twe fmdmgs of pneumocomosts It has been esttmated 
that this change ~111 result m more new benefit pay- 
ments than any other new provts~ons 

These changes m defmrttons and rules are particularly 
Important to the Soctal Security Admmlstratton because, 
m addltton to applymg to new clams, they ~111 be 
applted III a rewew of disallowed clatms About 
170,000 clmmants formerly demed benefits by the So- 
aal Security Admmtstratlon ~111 be contacted for pow- 
ble payment of cash beneftts under Part C of the pro- 
gram Clams allowed as a result of review by the Soctal 
Securtty Admmrstratton ~111 be payable retroactwely to 
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January 1, 1974 I” addltmn, the clams for cash bene- 
fits of some 70,000 persons prevtously disallowed by 
the Department of Labor ~111 be rewewed Clams re- 
caved and allowed by that agency wdl be payable re- 
troactwely to the onset of dtsabthty or, ,f that date can- 
not be determined, to the date of request for review of 
the cly~m, but no earher than January 1, 1974 

Medical Benefits 
Before the amendments, medtcal benefits for condo- 

ttons resulting from pneumocomosls were payable to 
mmers recewtng cash benefits under Part C of the pro- 
gram (clmms filed after December 31, 1973, and ad- 
mtmstered by the Department of Labor) Mmers re- 
cervtng Part B cash benefits (claims filed on or before 
December 31, 1973, and admlnlstered by the Socral Se- 
curlty Admlnlstratmn) now may also qualify for medical 
benefits under administration of the Department of 
Labor for the,, lung duorders The Soaal Secur,ty Ad- 
ministration will notify all Part B benefuarles of this 
prowston Beneficiaries ~111 then have 6 months I” 
which to churn medal benefits 

Offset for Workers’ Compensation 
Payments 

Fmmerly, Part B benefits were offset by the amount 
of workers’ compensation payments received for any 
type of dlsablhty The law now provtdes that Part B 
benefits ~111 be offset I” the same way as Part C bene- 
fits The offset will be made only for that part of the 
workers’ compensatmn benefit bemg pad for dlsablhty 
caused by miners’ pneumoconmsis The cost of this 
change to the Sow11 Security Admmtstratmn has been 
estimated at $8-$10 million annually through 1982 

Black Lung Disability Trust Fund 
Before the I977 amendments, the cost of benefits not 

attributable to individual employers was fmanced 
through general revenues Pubhc Law 95-227 estab- 
hshes a black lung dlsabtltty tmst fund to finance the 
cost of claims involving mmers whose last employment 
was before January 1, 1970, and those for whom no re- 
sponsible coal-mme operator has been identlfwd The 
fund ~111 also pay the admmtstrattve expenses involved 
m nnplementmg the I977 amendments for both the De- 
partment of Labor and the Soaal Security Admmistra- 
tmn 

The fund ~111 be supported by an excise tax payable 
by all local coal-mine operators, except where a State 
law has bee” certified by the Secretary of Labor as pro- 
viding adequate coverage for pneumoconmsas The tax 

will be levied on coal mined at the rate of 50 cents per 
ton for underground coal and 25 cents per ton for 
surface-mined coal, but the amount collected may not 
exceed 2 percent of the prxe at which the coal 1s sold by 
the producers Except for clams based on coal-mme 
employment before January 1, 1970, responsible 
operators wtll ,contmue as before to bear mdtwdual ha- 
b&y 

Social Security Abroad 

Italy’s Indexing, Minimum Benefits, 
and Pension Reform* 

Italy has changed its method of adJ”stmg social secu- 
rtty benefits from a formula based on movements I” the 
cost-of-hvmg mdex to one based on combmed changes 
m the cost-of-lrvmg and wage mdexes The changes 
have tended to aggravate the fmancial problems of the 
system, which has been operatmg at a defwt Interest- 
mgly, m a m”ve to curb sharp expenditure ,“creases, 
cost-of-ltvmg mcreases for htgh benefits were pad m 
the form of Government bonds that can”“t be redeemed 
for 5 years 

Foreign countries have adopted a vartety of ap- 
proaches to penodic adJ”stment of pensmns Generally, 
either a price or a wage Index 1s used Price I”- 
dexmg-the tradmonal, m”re conservat,ve approach- 
tries to mamtam a worker’s standard of lwmg at the 
time, of retlrement Wage Indexing, somettmes called 
the dynamic approach, ttes the penslo” to what the re- 
tlree would earn If he were currently employed Thus 
the pensioner shares m improvements I” the standard of 
hv’ng enjoyed by the actwe labor force 

Benefits were Indexed ,n 34 countr,es I” 1975 A 
prtce mdex was used by 20 of these countries, and a 
wage index was used by 11 countnes Three addltronal 
countrtes used a mtmmum wage index ’ Italy, Norway, 
and Uruguay were the first countries to combine 
changes t” wages and prrces t” the,, formula for au- 
tomatlc adJustmat of pensmns 

The new Italian formula was devised for two reasons 
Wages were mcreasmg more rapIdly than prtces and It 
was felt that the value of penstons should be related to 
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